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Not too long ago I received an email that referred to the left-wing media as “journo-
terrorists.”  You may have heard the term recently on Fox News but it probably did not 
register with you. 
 
This has been a rather obscure term until recently when used by a news host to 
describe two journalists of perverting the news and teaching that perversion in 
journalism classes. 
 
“Journal-terrorist” refers to journalists who promote fear or terror in their readers or 
viewers.  Instead of reporting a “balanced” view of a story, the journalist uses the 
opportunity in an attempt to strike fear into the hearts of the reader/viewer.  Words and 
phrases are carefully chosen to incite a population.   
 
These terrorists promote a narrative that is pushed by left-wing extremists, of which the 
three major narratives are racism, government control, and censorship.  Their actions 
are an attempt to keep the real truth from the people by presenting alternative “truths.” 
 
If we open our eyes and minds, we will notice that instead of presenting events in a 
balanced manner, they distort events, hide the truth, and present entirely false or fake 
news. 
 
For decades the media, in general, has taken the liberal side of politics.  This has 
become so pervasive in society that  we rarely get the full story of an event and instead 
of reporting facts, almost every story contains commentary and suppositions.   
 
When the facts and truth come out, there is rarely an apology from the media for their 
actions, especially when it comes to destroying the lives of others.  Look at almost any 
story dealing with people being killed.  Before the facts came out, Kyle Rittenhouse was 
accused of white supremacy and killing two black men.  The media spread these lies 
without ever checking to see what the facts were.  Even Biden had made negative 
statements before having any facts. 
 
While we are quick to judge, the media is even quicker in their judgment to find guilt 
instead of presumed innocence before they know the facts. 
 
These terrorist actions by the media and journalists can be changed and you can be 
part of the catalysis to bring about this change.  But you have to take action. Your fate 
and that of you children, your community, and Americans is in your hands.  You have 
only two options.  Will you become a person who will. . . 
 

1. Explain what freedom WAS, or  
2. Explain what censorship WAS... 



There's a war going on between the two.  And if we don't all do our part, we will get 
censorship and tyranny by default. 


